



**City of Sugar Land Bid Opening
ITB 2019-29 Purchase of Auto Parts
August 15, 2019; 11:00 am**

Witnesses

Name	Agency	Signature
Jason Poscovsky	City of Sugar Land	
Todd Reed	City of Sugar Land	

	Bids Received				
	AJ HURT	AUTO PLUS	HELFMAN FORD	WAHLBERG - MCCREARY	IMC
	8/15/2019 @ 10:00 a.m.	8/15/2019 @ 8:00 a.m.	8/13/2019 @ 10:41 a.m.	8/13/2019 @ 8:54 a.m.	8/14/2019 @ 10:03 a.m.
SECTION I: FILTERS	No Bid	\$41.45	No Bid	\$22.78	\$56.01
SECTION II: LIGHTING	No Bid	\$7.89	No Bid	\$6.71	\$8.88
SECTION III: BRAKE SYSTEM	No Bid	\$668.03	\$68.69	\$563.14	\$52.94
SECTION IV: MISCELLANEOUS	\$30.25	\$158.92	No Bid	\$183.57	\$23.45
SECTION V: ELECTRICAL	No Bid	\$322.44	No Bid	\$157.50	\$343.85
SECTION VI: PUMPS	No Bid	\$435.07	\$575.19	\$243.47	\$408.30
SECTION VII: BLADES	No Bid	\$31.20	No Bid	\$27.20	\$22.46
SECTION VIII: BATTERIES	No Bid	\$795.82	No Bid	\$559.26	\$576.79
GRAND TOTAL	\$30.25	\$2,460.82	\$643.88	\$1,763.63	\$1,492.68